
Item No. Description Unit Estimated 
Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Scope A: Steel Reinforced Polyethylene (SRPE) 36”
LF 810  $             190.00  $        153,900.00  $             147.40  $        119,394.00  $             157.70  $        127,737.00 

2 Scope B: Steel Reinforced Polyethylene (SRPE) 96”
LF 180 870.00$               $        156,600.00 688.95$               $        124,011.00 737.55$               $        132,759.00 

3 Scope A: Fiberglass Reinforced Polymer Mortar (FRPM) 
Pipe 36” LF 810 145.00$              117,450.00$         no bid no bid no bid no bid

4 Scope B: Fiberglass Reinforced Polymer Mortar (FRPM) 
Pipe 96” LF 180 695.00$              125,100.00$         no bid no bid no bid no bid

5 Scope A: 36” SDR 32.5 IPS and fusing the pipe. LF 810 220.00$              178,200.00$         no bid no bid no bid no bid

6 Scope B: 7’x7’x4’ Precast Concrete Box Culvert LF 180 750.00$              135,000.00$         1,045.00$           188,100.00$         no bid no bid

Preliminary Tabulation: May 11, 2026

P.O. Box 6
Stowell, TX 77661

Bids Opened:May 7, 2026
Preliminary Tabulation: May 11, 2026
Date Awarded: 
Final Tabulation: 
Three bids received 

IFB 26-006/SC Borley Heights Pipe Culvert Seabreeze Aluminum Culvert

Phone: 409-296-4098

Attn: Ed Meaux
ed@seabreezeculvert.com

Coburn Supply
1000 Bowie St. 

Beaumont, TX 77701
Attn: Jason Savoy

djsavoy@coburns.com
Phone: 409-835-1447

Brystar
8385 Chemical Road
Beaumont, TX 77705
Attn: Trevor Holmes
trevor@brystar.com

Phone: 409-659-7334
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