
Final Tabulation: January 30, 2024

Vendor
Line 
Item

Truck Size
Equipment 

Rate Charge 
Per Hour

Equipment 
Volume Rate: 

Concrete 
Pumping Per Cy 

(1-100)

Equipment 
Volume Rate: 

Concrete 
Pumping Per Cy 

(Over 101)

Travel Charge 
Per Hour

Primer Bag

1 32 Meter  $            200.00  $                 3.00  $                 3.00  $            200.00  $               35.00 
2 36 meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

910 N. Rose City Drive 3 38 meter  $            225.00  $                 3.40  $                 3.40  $            225.00  $               35.00 
Vidor, Texas 77662 4 40 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Phone: 409-422-4767 5 46 meter  $            250.00  $                 3.75  $                 3.75  $            250.00  $               35.00 
Contact: Derek Dews 6 58 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
coastlinepumping@gmail.com 7 63 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening. The District has not checked the bids for errors, or made any

determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements. In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.

Coast Line Concrete Pumping, LLC

Bids Opened: January 25, 2024

One Bid Received
Awarded Items in Yellow

IFB 21-017/KJS Term Contract for 
Concrete Pumping Truck Services
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