
Bids Opened: August 31, 2023
Final Tabulation: August 31, 2023
Date Awarded:
Execution of Offer:
Four Bids Received
Purchases Made-First by Price, Then Availability

Line 
Item

Item 
No.

Item 
Descr.

Description
Unit Price  
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 
Miles

10 to 15 
Miles

15 to 25 
Miles

25 Plus 
Miles

Unit Price  
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 
Miles

10 to 15 
Miles

15 to 25 
Miles

25 Plus 
Miles

Unit Price  
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 
Miles

10 to 15 
Miles

15 to 25 
Miles

25 Plus 
Miles

Unit Price  
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 
Miles

10 to 15 
Miles

15 to 25 
Miles

25 Plus 
Miles 

Ton/Mile 
1 132 6000 Embankment - Type C (10<PI≤15) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 132 6001 Embankment Cohesionless Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 247 6000 Flexible Base – Type D GR1-2  $      38.00 No Bid  $      7.15  $      7.81  $      9.90  $    16.50  $      37.00 No Bid  $    42.00  $    45.00  $    47.00  $    49.00  $      35.00  $      38.50  $   39.50  $    41.50  $    44.50  $    46.50  $      41.00 No Bid  $    52.00  $    54.00  $    57.00  $      61.00 
4 247 6001 Flexible Base – Type D GR1-2  $      38.00 No Bid  $      7.15  $      7.81  $      9.90  $    16.50  $      37.00 No Bid  $    42.00  $    45.00  $    47.00  $    49.00  $      42.00  $      45.50  $   46.50  $    48.50  $    51.50  $    53.50  $      65.00 No Bid  $    76.00  $    78.00  $    81.00  $      85.00 
5 247 6002 No. 57 Limestone Rock  $      50.00 No Bid  $      7.15  $      7.81  $      9.90  $    16.50  $      50.00 No Bid  $    55.00  $    58.00  $    60.00  $    62.00  $      55.00  $      58.50  $   59.50  $    61.50  $    64.50  $    66.50  $      67.00 No Bid  $    78.00  $    80.00  $    83.00  $      87.00 
6 247 6003 610 Base  $      50.00 No Bid  $      7.15  $      7.81  $      9.90  $    16.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      60.00  $      63.50  $   64.50  $    66.50  $    69.50  $    71.50  $      64.00 No Bid  $    75.00  $    77.00  $    80.00  $      84.00 

7 276 6057 Cement Treatment (Plant-Mixed) Flexible Base-Class 
L (3-sack)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      63.00 No Bid  $    68.00  $    71.00  $    73.00  $    75.00  $      70.00  $      73.50  $   74.50  $    76.50  $    79.50  $    81.50  $      98.00 No Bid  $  109.00  $  111.00  $  114.00  $    118.00 

8 276 6058 Cement Treatment (Plant-Mixed) Flexible Base-Class 
L (4-sack)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      70.50 No Bid  $    75.50  $    78.50  $    80.50  $    82.50  $      80.00  $      83.50  $   84.50  $    86.50  $    89.50  $    91.50  $    111.00 No Bid  $  122.00  $  124.00  $  127.00  $    131.00 

9 276 6059 Cement Treatment (Plant-Mixed) Flexible Base-Class 
L (5-sack)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      79.00 No Bid  $    84.00  $    87.00  $    89.00  $    91.00  $      90.00  $      93.50  $   94.50  $    96.50  $    99.50  $  101.50  $    124.00 No Bid  $  135.00  $  137.00  $  140.00  $    144.00 

10 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (1-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      31.00 No Bid  $    36.00  $    39.00  $    41.00  $    43.00  $      29.99  $      33.49  $   34.49  $    36.49  $    39.50  $    41.50  $      45.00 No Bid  $    56.00  $    58.00  $    61.00  $      65.00 
11 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (1.5-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      35.50 No Bid  $    40.50  $    43.50  $    45.50  $    47.50  $      33.99  $      37.49  $   38.49  $    40.49  $    43.49  $    45.49  $      53.00 No Bid  $    64.00  $    66.00  $    69.00  $      73.00 
12 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (2-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      40.00 No Bid  $    45.00  $    48.00  $    50.00  $    52.00  $      39.99  $      43.49  $   44.49  $    46.49  $    49.49  $    51.49  $      60.00 No Bid  $    71.00  $    73.00  $    78.00  $      80.00 
13 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (3-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      47.50 No Bid  $    52.50  $    55.50  $    57.50  $    59.50  $      47.99  $      51.49  $   52.49  $    54.49  $    57.49  $    59.49  $      72.00 No Bid  $    83.00  $    85.00  $    88.00  $      92.00 
14 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (4-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      55.50 No Bid  $    60.50  $    63.50  $    65.50  $    67.50  $      59.99  $      63.49  $   64.49  $    66.49  $    69.49  $    71.49  $      80.00 No Bid  $    91.00  $    93.00  $    96.00  $    100.00 
15 400 6005 Cement-Stabilized Sand (5-sack) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      63.50 No Bid  $    68.50  $    71.50  $    73.50  $    75.50  $      69.99  $      73.49  $   74.49  $    76.49  $    79.49  $    81.49  $      95.00 No Bid  $  106.00  $  108.00  $  111.00  $    115.00 
16 432 6001 Rip-Rap Stone 1”x3” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $      48.00 No Bid  $    53.00  $    56.00  $    58.00  $    60.00  $      46.99  $      50.49  $   51.49  $    53.49  $    56.49  $    58.49  $      67.00 No Bid  $    78.00  $    80.00  $    83.00  $      87.00 
17 432 6002 Rip-Rap Stone 3”x5”  $      45.00 No Bid  $    53.25  $    53.91  $    56.00  $    62.60  $      48.00 No Bid  $    53.00  $    56.00  $    58.00  $    60.00  $      46.99  $      50.49  $   51.49  $    53.49  $    56.49  $    58.49  $      67.00 No Bid  $    78.00  $    80.00  $    83.00  $      87.00 
18 432 6016 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 12”  $      90.00 No Bid  $    99.35  $  100.01  $  102.10  $  108.70  $      55.00 No Bid  $    60.00  $    60.00  $    65.00  $    67.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $    145.00 No Bid  $  156.00  $  158.00 No Bid  $    165.00 
19 432 6017 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 18”  $      18.00 No Bid  $    28.45  $    29.11  $    31.20  $    37.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 
Item

Item 
No.

Item 
Descr.

Class of Concrete with 100% Cement and (psi)

1 401 6001 Flowable Backfill
2 421 6001 CL (A)
3 421 6002 CL (B)
4 421 6003 CL (C)
5 421 6004 CL (P)
6 421 6005 CL (HES)

Surcharge
3.76$         4.00$         20.00$    
4.01$         4.25$         25.00$    
4.26$         4.50$         30.00$    
4.51$         4.75$         35.00$    

4.76$         5.00$         40.00$    
5.01$         5.25$         45.00$    
5.26$         5.50$         50.00$    
5.51$         5.75$         55.00$    
5.76$         60.00$       60.00$    
6.01$         6.25$         65.00$    
6.26$         6.50$         70.00$    
6.51$         6.75$         75.00$    
6.76$         7.00$         80.00$    

 No Bid  No Bid 
*A Fuel Surcharge per load will
apply while fuel prices exceed 

$3.75/gl.

* Per Load. For loads less than
5CY Not 9 CY

Avg. Diesel Price

202.00$   No Bid  No Bid  $ 173.00  $ 200.00  $ 182.00 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $ 149.00  $ 200.00  $   158.00 178.00$   No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $ 143.00  $ 200.00  $   159.00 179.00$  

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $ 137.00  $ 200.00  $   152.00 172.00$   No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $ 143.00  $ 200.00  $   152.00 172.00$  

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)         

Short Load Iess Than 9 C.Y.

 No Bid  No Bid  $ 110.00  $ 200.00  $ 119.00 139.00$   No Bid  No Bid 

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)         

Short Load Iess Than 9 C.Y.
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)*

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)         
Short Load Iess Than 9 C.Y.*

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)         

Short Load Iess Than 9 C.Y.

210-524-3526 409-835-4933 409-840-2080 409-866-1444

HEAVY MATERIALS

(IFB 23-013/KJS) Term Contract Heavy Materials 
Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC. Martin Marietta Materials, Inc Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company

Attn: Julia Farrar Attn: Bill Kelley

CONCRETE Knife River Corporation-South Martin Marietta Materials, Inc Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company

Attn: Trent Almond Attn: Kimberly Work
farrarj@vmcmail.com william.kelley@martinmarietta.com talmond@modernconcretetx.com kimberly.work@gc-texas.com

5675 Fannett Road 2090 West Cardinal Road 12907 US Highway 90
San Antonio, TX 78216 Beaumont, Texas 77705 Beaumont, Texas 77705 Beaumont, Texas 77713

10101 Reunion Place Ste 500
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