
Final Tabulation: April 26, 2023
Bids Opened:March 30, 2023
Final Tabulation: April 6, 2023
Date Awarded April 6, 2023
Execution of Offer  April 26, 2023
Four Bids Received- All Vendors Awarded 
Purchases Made-First by Price, Then Availability

Product  Description Brand Bid Mfgr.
 Container Size - 

UOM
Price Per-UOM Brand Bid Mfgr.

 Container Size - 
UOM

Price Per-UOM Brand Bid Mfgr.
 Container Size - 

UOM
Price Per-UOM Brand Bid Mfgr.

 Container Size - 
UOM

Price Per-UOM

1 – Gal 296.43$              1 – Gal 296.43$              1 – Gal 405.12$              1 – Gal No bid
15-Gal 295.65$              15-Gal 295.65$              15-Gal No bid 15-Gal No bid
1 – Gal No bid 1 – Gal 193.90$              1 – Gal No bid 1 – Gal 216.00 2.5 gal
15-Gal No bid 15-Gal No bid 15-Gal 1,110.42$           15-Gal No bid

MILESTONE Milestone Corteva 2.5- Gal 325.00$              Milestone Corteva 2.5- Gal 325.00$              Milestone Dow Agro 2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid
Equivalent 2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid Whetstone Alligare 2.5- Gal 272.00 gal

16- Oz 2.42 oz 8- Oz 2.80$  8- Oz No bid 8- Oz No bid
48-Oz No bid 48-Oz No bid 48-Oz No bid 48-Oz No bid
8- Oz No bid 8- Oz No bid 8- Oz 48.65$                8- Oz 2.28oz -16 oz
48-Oz No bid 48-Oz No bid 48-Oz No bid 48-Oz 2.23oz -64 oz

POLARIS 
Arsenal 

Herbicide
BASF

2.5 - gal 75.28$                2.5 - Oz No bid
Polaris Nufarm

2.5 - Gal 257.10$              2.5 - Oz No bid

Equivalent 2.5 - Oz No bid
Ecomazapyr 2SL Alligare

2.5 - Oz 67.84 gal 2.5 - Oz No bid
Ecomaza Pyr Alligare

2.5 - Oz 68.00 gal
2.5 – Oz 23.98 gal 2.5 – Oz 22.40 gal 2.5 – Gal 83.03$                2.5 – Oz No bid
30- Gal 23.18$                30- Gal 21.20$                30- Gal No bid 30- Gal No bid
2.5 – Oz 20.48 gal 2.5 – Oz No bid 2.5 – Oz No bid 2.5 – Oz 16.90 gal
30- Gal 19.82 gal 30- Gal No bid 30- Gal No bid 30- Gal 16.10 gal

2.5 – Gal 31.52 gal 2.5 – Gal 29.90$                2.5 – Gal 115.31$              2.5 – Gal No bid
30- Gal 30.60 gal 30- Gal 28.90$                30- Gal No bid 30- Gal No bid

2.5 – Gal 26.24 gal 2.5 – Gal 25.00$                2.5 – Gal No bid 2.5 – Gal No bid
30- Gal 25.84 gal 30- Gal No bid 30- Gal No bid 30- Gal No bid
2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal 87.82$                2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid
250- Gal No bid 250- Gal 85.48$                250- Gal No bid 250- Gal No bid
2.5- Gal 49.22 gal 2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal 211.59$              2.5- Gal 67.00 gal
250- Gal No bid 250- Gal No bid 250- Gal No bid 250- Gal No bid

1- Qt. No bid 1- Qt. 11.60$                1- Qt. No bid 1- Qt. 9.00gal -2.5gal
1- Gal No bid 1- Gal No bid 1- Gal No bid 1- Gal No bid
1- Qt. 12.48 qt 1- Qt. No bid 1- Qt. No bid 1- Qt. No bid
1- Gal 35.66 gal 1- Gal No bid 1- Gal No bid 1- Gal No bid
1-Pt. No bid 1-Pt. 7.95$  1-Pt. No bid 1-Pt. No bid

1 - Gal No bid 1 - Gal 32.82$                1 - Gal No bid 1 - Gal No bid
1-Pt. 11.25 qt 1-Pt. No bid 1-Pt. No bid 1-Pt. 28.00 qt *low we rate

1 - Gal 32.88 gal 1 - Gal No bid 1 - Gal 27.95$                1 - Gal No bid
DLZ 2.5 - Gal No bid DLZ Helena-Agri 2.5 - Gal 28.46$                2.5 - Gal No bid 2.5 - Gal No bid

Equivalent
Elite Velocity

Red River 
Specialties

2.5 - Gal 33.18 gal

MSO Premium 
(Non-buffered)

Helena-Agri
2.5 - Gal 17.82$                2.5 - Gal No bid

Highload MSO
Wilbur-Ellis/ 

Channel Partners
2.5 - Gal 18.25 gal

DYNE-AMIC 2.5- Gal No bid                                      Helena-Agri 2.5- Gal 45.30$                2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid

Equivalent
Elite Pinnacle

Red River 
Specialties

2.5- Gal 29.68 gal 2.5- Gal No bid
MSO Lesco

2.5- Gal 25.64 gal
Zone Coverage

Wilbur-Ellis/ 
Channel Partners

2.5- Gal 32.75 gal

Aquatic Surfactant
RRSI NIS

Red River 
Specialties 2.5- Gal 12.47 gal

Inlet Helena-Agri
2.5- Gal 18.48$                2.5- Gal No bid 2.5- Gal No bid

Equivalent RRSI NIS
Red River 
Specialties 2.5- Gal 12.47 gal Induce PH Helena-Agri 2.5- Gal 27.40$                Sixteen 90 Aquatrols 2.5- Gal 188.60$              R-11 Wilbur-Ellis 2.5- Gal 22.85 gal

 (IFB 23-002/SC) Term Contract for Herbicides 

admin@spurgeraviation.com
Attn: James Smart

Spurger, Texas 77660
319 Private Road 8460

Spurger Aviation, LLC.Red River Specialties LLC
1324 North Hearne Ave. Ste., 120

Shreveport, LA 71107
Attn: Chad Chambliss

CLEARCAST 

Equivalent

Alligare MSM 
60DF 

MSM 60DF 

chad.chambliss@rrsi.com
Phone: 318-425-5944

Alligare

Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC
41232-B Park 290

Waller, Texas
Attn: Kelly Duffie

duffiek@helenaagri.com
Phone: 281-415-7301

SiteOne Landscape Supply
1385 E. 36th Street

Cleveland, Ohio 44114
Attn: John Morgan

jmorgan@siteone.com
Phone: 281-520-8580 Phone: 409-291-0760

ACCURACY 

Equivalent

FOAMBUSTER 

Equivalent

Clearcast Sepro Clearcast SePRO Corp

Castaway

RANGER PRO 

Equivalent

ROUNDUP CUSTOM 

Equivalent

TRYCERA 

Equivalent

Equivalent

Roundup 
Custom

Bayer

Aquaneat Nufarm

Ranger Pro Bayer

Credit 41 Extra Nufarm

RRSI Defoamer
Red River 
Specialties

Foambuster Helena-Agri

Element 3a Corteva- Amine

Elite Secure Ultra
Red River 
Specialties

Trycera
Helena-Agri- 

Acid

Aquaneat Nufarm

Roundup 
Custom

Bayer

Accuracy Helena-Agri

Ranger Pro Monsanto

MSM 60DF Helena-Agri

Atticus

Clearcast Sepro

Ranger Pro Bayer

Nofoam A
Creative 

Marketing

Triclopyr 4 Ester Lesco

Roundup 
Custom

Monsanto

FTF Defoamer Wilbur-Ellis

Buccaneer Plus Tenkoz

Garlon 3A Ester Corteva

D Guard Wilbur-Ellis

Escort XP ENVU

IMOX Alligare

Lesco Mansion Lesco
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