
Item 
No. 

Description Unit
Estimated 
Quantity

Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price

1.1
Precast Concrete Box Culvert (4’x6’) LF 400  $              567.00  $      226,800.00  $              580.00  $      232,000.00 No Bid No Bid  $              780.00 312,000.00$       

Item 
No. 

Description Unit
Estimated 
Quantity

Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price

2.1

Closed Cell Block 
(Armortec Armoflex Closed Cell Block 

 45-S) or EQUIVALENT
SF 3,269 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $ 6.43  $         21,019.67  $                 12.00  $         39,228.00 

Item 
No. 

Description Unit
Estimated 
Quantity

Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price Price Per Unit Total Price

3.1
#2 Pressure-Treated Timber

4 in. x 4 in. x 8 ft
EA 50 No Bid No Bid

 $                 14.50  $              725.00 
No Bid No Bid  $                 18.70  $              935.00 

3.2
Pressure-Treated Pine Dog-Ear Fence Picket

5/8 in. x 5-1/2  in. x 6 ft.
EA 712 No Bid No Bid

 $ 3.00  $           2,136.00 
No Bid No Bid  $ 4.99  $           3,552.88 

3.3
#2 Rough Pressure-Treated Board

1 in. x 6 in. x 16 ft.
EA 23 No Bid No Bid

 $                 24.00  $              552.00 
No Bid No Bid  $                 10.63  $              244.49 

3.4
#2 Rough Pressure-Treated Board

2  in. x 6 in. x 16 ft. EA 68 No Bid No Bid  $                 18.00  $           1,224.00 No Bid No Bid  $                 18.90  $           1,285.20 

 $      252,456.67 

IFB 22-026/KJS  Materials For 
Drainage Ditch 110-B CDBG-DR Project

Final Tabulation October 13, 2022
Date Awarded: November 8, 2022

 Execution of Offer: November 8, 2022
 Four Bids Received

Section 2- Articulating Mats

Total Materials

Section 1- Box Culverts

Section 2- Articulating Mats

rrasberry@actpipe.com

Coburn Supply
1995 Cedar St.

Beaumont, TX 77701
Contact: Jason Savoy
Phone: 409-284-4184

troush@superior-waste.com

ACT Pipe & Supply
1405 Ashley St.

Beaumont, TX 77701
Contact:Rick M. Rasberry

Phone: 409-813-2796
ttullier@premier-concrete.com

Hartmann Building Specialties
9610 Walden Road

Beaumont, Texas 77707
Contact: Dennis Sorensen

Phone: 409-866-6103
dsorensen@hbsltd.net

Premier Concrete
38200 La HWY 16

Denham Spring, LA 70706
Contact: Tyler Tullier
Phone: 225-413-8287
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