(IFB 22-025/KJS) Term Contract Heavy Materials

Bids Opened:September 15, 2022

Final Tabulation: September 16, 2022

Date Awarded September 16, 2022

Execution of Offer September 16, 2022

Four Bids Received- All Vendors Awarded
Purchases Made-First by Price, Then Availability

Knife River Corporation-South
4825 Romeda Road
Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Toby Burns
toby.burns@kniferiver.com
409-673-2669

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc
5675 Fannett Road
Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Bill Kelley
william.kelley@martinmarietta.com
409-658-7791

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
2090 West Cardinal Road
Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Trent Almond
talmond@modernconcretetx.com
409-840-2080

Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company

12907 US Highway 90
Beaumont, Texas 77713
Attn: Scott Blanchard
scott.blanchard@gc-texas.com
409-866-1444

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Li It 10to15 15t0 25 10t0 15 15t0 25 10to 15 15t0 25 10t015 15t025 |25 Plus Mil
" | tem No.| o Description Picked-Up | Delivered |5 to 10 Miles © © 25 Plus Miles| Picked-Up | Delivered |5 to 10 Miles © © 25 Plus Miles| Picked-Up | Delivered |5 to 10 Miles © © 25 Plus Miles| Picked-Up | Delivered |5 to 10 Miles © © us Miles
Item Descr. Miles Miles Miles Miles Miles Miles Miles Miles Ton/Mile
(Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton) (Per Ton)
1 247 | 6000 Flexible Base — Type D GR1-2 $  40.00| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ 3400 |$ 3800 $ 39.00 [$ 4100 |$ 4400 |$ 4600 |$ 3200| $ 3600|$ 3800 4000|$  4200($ 4500 [$  23.00 NoBid [$ 3100 |$ 3275 [$ 3450 |$  37.00
2 247 6001 Flexible Base — Type D GR1-2 $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 44.00( $ 46.00 [ $ 48.00( $ 50.00 | $ 53.00 | $ 43.00 No Bid $ 51.00 | $ 5275 | $ 54.50 | $ 57.00
3 247 | 6002 No. 57 Limestone Rock $  50.00| NosBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ 4200 |$ 4600 [$  47.00 [$ 4900 |$ 5200 |$ 5400 |$ 5000| $ 5400/ $ 5600 5800[$  60.00($ 6300 [$  48.00 NoBid [$ 5600 ($ 5775 [$ 5950 |$  62.00
4 247 6003 610 Base $ 70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 45.00 No Bid $ 53.00 | $ 54.75 | $ 56.50 | $ 59.00
s | 276 | eoor | CementTreatment ‘E:;':'lw'"d) Flexible Base- | ¢ 7600 |  Nogid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [$ 4200 [$ 4600 |$  47.00 |$  49.00 |$ 5200 |$ 5400 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [$ 5800 | NoBid |$ 6600 |$ 67.75|$ 6950 |$ 7200
6 400 | 6002 | Cement-Stabilized Sand (3-sack/CY) Plant Mixed | $  60.00 |  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ 4500 |$  49.00 [$ 5000 |$ 5200 [$ 5500 $  57.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |[$  53.00 NoBid [$ 6100 |$ 6275 (% 6450 |$  67.00
8 432 | 6001 Rip-Rap Stone 1”x3” $  50.00| NosBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ 4200 |$ 4600 [$ 4700 |$  49.00 [$ 5200 [$  54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |[$  45.00 NoBid [$ 5300 ($ 5475 (% 5650 |$  59.00
9 432 6002 Rip-Rap Stone 3"x5” $ 50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42,00 | $ 46.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 52.00 | $ 54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 45.00 No Bid $ 53.00 | $ 54.75 | $ 56.50 | $ 59.00
10 432 | 6003 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 7500 NoBid |$ 8000|$ 8200|$ 8500 (%  87.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 432 6004 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 18" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CONCRETE Knife River Corporation-South Martin Marietta Materials, Inc Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company
Line Item L . Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short . . Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short L . Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short L . Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short
i i Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y. Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)* Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y. Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.
ftem Item No. Descr. Class of Concrete with 100% Cement and (psi) nit Price Delivered (Per ) Load less Than 9 C.Y. nit Price Delivered (Per ) Load less Than 9 C.Y.* nit Price Delivered (Per ) I nit Price Delivered (Per ) I
1 401 | 6001 Flowable Backfill $ 150.00| $ 190.00 | $ 111.00[ $ 200.00| $ 105.00[ § 110.00 No Bid No Bid
2 421 6001 CL(A) $ 175.00| $ 200.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 200.00( $ 14500 $ 150.00 No Bid No Bid
3 421 | 6002 CL(B) S 175.00[ § 200.00 | $ 138.00] § 200.00] $ 145.00 [ § 150.00 No Bid No Bid
4 421 6003 CL(C) $ 185.00| $ 200.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 200.00( $ 155.00| $ 160.00 No Bid No Bid
5 421 | 6004 CL(P) S 190.00[ § 21000 | $ 150.00] § 200.00] $ 160.00 [ § 165.00 No Bid No Bid
6 421 6005 CL (HES) $ 215.00| 250.00 | $ 174.00 | $ 200.00( $ 180.00| $ 185.00 No Bid No Bid

*A Fuel Surcharge per load will apply.
while fuel prices exceed $3.75/gl.

* For loads less than 5CY Not 9 CY

Avg. Diesel Price Surcgarge
S 376 | $ 4.00 |$  20.00
$ 401]$ 425|%  25.00
S 426 | S 450 |$  30.00
$ 451]$ 475|$ 3500
S 4.76 | $ 5.00 | $  40.00
$ 501]$ 525|%  45.00
S 526 |$ 550 | $  50.00
$ 551]$ 575|% 5500
S 576 [$  60.00 [$  60.00
$ 6.01]$ 625|% 6500
S 6.26 | S 6.50 | $  70.00
$ 651 ]S 675|$  75.00
$ 6.76 | $ 7.00 | $  80.00
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