
Bids Opened:September 9, 2021
Final Tabulation: September 10, 2021
Date Awarded September 14, 2021
Execution of Offer  September 14, 2021
Four Bids Received- All Vendors Awarded
Purchases Made-First by Price, Then Availability

Line 
Item

Item No.
Item 

Descr.
Description

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 Miles
10 to 15 

Miles
15 to 25 

Miles
25 Plus Miles

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 Miles
10 to 15 

Miles
15 to 25 

Miles
25 Plus Miles

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 Miles
10 to 15 

Miles
15 to 25 

Miles
25 Plus Miles

Unit Price 
Delivered 
(Per Ton)

Unit Price 
Picked-Up 
(Per Ton)

5 to 10 Miles
10 to 15 

Miles
15 to 25 

Miles
25 Plus Miles 

Ton/Mile 

1 247 6001 Flexible Base – Type A  GR1-2 No Bid  $          30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          32.00  $          26.00  $          31.00  $          32.00  $          34.00  $          35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          29.00  $          29.00  $          35.00  $          36.50  $          37.50  $            0.30 

2 247 6002 No. 57 Limestone Rock No Bid  $          35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          38.00  $          32.00  $          37.00  $          38.00  $          40.00  $          41.00 No Bid  $          35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          40.00  $          40.00  $          46.00  $          47.50  $          48.50  $            0.30 

3 247 6003 610 Base No Bid  $          50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          38.00  $          32.00  $          37.00  $          38.00  $          40.00  $          41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          34.00  $          34.00  $          40.00  $          41.50  $          42.50  $            0.30 

4
276 6001

Cement Treatment (Plant-Mixed) Flexible Base-
Class L

No Bid  $          47.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          43.00  $          37.00  $          42.00  $          43.00  $          45.00  $          46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          45.00  $          45.00  $          51.00  $          52.50  $          53.50  $            0.30 

5
400 6001

Cement-Stabilized Sand (1.5-sack/CY) Plant 
Mixed

No Bid  $          30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          30.50  $          25.00  $          30.00  $          31.00  $          33.00  $          34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          26.50  $          26.50  $          32.50  $          34.00  $          35.00  $            0.30 

6
400 6002 Cement-Stabilized Sand (3-sack/CY) Plant Mixed No Bid  $          40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          40.50  $          35.00  $          40.00  $          41.00  $          43.00  $          44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          36.00  $          36.00  $          42.00  $          43.50  $          44.50  $            0.30 

7
400 6003 Cement-Stabilized Sand (4-sack/CY) Plant Mixed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          46.50  $          40.50  $          45.50  $          46.50  $          48.50  $          49.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          47.50  $          47.50  $          53.50  $          55.00  $          56.00  $            0.30 

8 432 6001 Rip-Rap Stone 1”x3” No Bid  $          36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          40.00  $          34.00  $          39.00  $          40.00  $          42.00  $          43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          34.50  $          34.50  $          40.50  $          42.00  $          43.00  $            0.30 

9 432 6002 Rip-Rap Stone 3”x5” No Bid  $          36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          40.00  $          34.00  $          39.00  $          40.00  $          42.00  $          43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          34.50  $          34.50  $          40.50  $          42.00  $          43.00  $            0.30 

10 432 6003 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 12” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $          81.00  $          75.00  $          80.00  $          81.00  $          83.00  $          84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 432 6004 Rip-Rap (Stone Protection) 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 432 6005 Rip-Rap Bedding Stone 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line 
Item

Item No.
Item 

Descr.
Class of Concrete with 100% Cement

1 401 6001 Flowable Backfill
2 421 6001 A
3 421 6002 C
4 421 6003 S
5 421 6004 P
6 421 6005 SS
7 421 6006 HES  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 $ 130.00 130.00$  
 $ 170.00 170.00$  
 $ 250.00 250.00$  

 $ 120.00 120.00$  
 $ 130.00 130.00$  
 $ 130.00 130.00$  

 $ 127.00  No Bid 
 $ 130.00  No Bid 
 $ 155.00  No Bid 

 $ 119.00  No Bid 
 $ 122.00  No Bid 
 $ 127.00  No Bid 

 $ 135.00 
 $ 130.00 
 $ 146.00 

107.00$  
128.00$  
136.00$  
140.00$  
145.00$  
150.00$  
170.00$  

 $ 118.00 
 $ 126.00 
 $ 130.00 

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company

 $ 90.00 

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short Load 

Item 421 Only- Less Than 9 C.Y.

 No Bid  No Bid 

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short Load 

Item 421 Only- Less Than 9 C.Y.

 $ 90.00 90.00$   

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short Load 

Item 421 Only- Less Than 9 C.Y.

 No Bid 

CONCRETE

HEAVY MATERIALS

Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.)
Unit Price Delivered (Per C.Y.) Short Load 

Item 421 Only- Less Than 9 C.Y.

Knife River Corporation-South

409-866-1444

Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf Coast a CRH Company
12907 US Highway 90

Beaumont, Texas 77713
Attn: Artie Tucker

arthur.tucker@gc-texas.comwilliam.kelley@martinmarietta.com 
409-658-7791

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
2090 West Cardinal Road
Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Trent Almond
talmond@modernconcretetx.com

409-840-2080

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc
5675 Fannett Road

Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Bill Kelley

(IFB 21-029/KJS) Term Contract Heavy Materials and Byrd Gully Ditch 1205- FMA Grant Project

Attn: Toby Burns
toby.burns@kniferiver.com

409-673-2669

Knife River Corporation-South
4825 Romeda Road

Beaumont, Texas 77705
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