
Final Tabulation: September 7, 2021

Vendor
Line 
Item

Truck Size
Equipment Rate 

Charge Per 
Hour

Equipment 
Volume Rate: 

Concrete 
Pumping Per Cy 

(1-100)

Equipment 
Volume Rate: 

Concrete 
Pumping Per Cy 

(Over 101)

Travel Charge 
Per Hour

Primer Bag

1 32 Meter  $             150.00  $                 2.50  $                 2.50  $             150.00  $               30.00 
2 36 meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

910 N. Rose City Drive 3 38 meter  $             165.00  $                 2.65  $                 2.65  $             165.00  $               30.00 
Vidor, Texas 77662 4 40 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Phone: 409-422-4767 5 46 meter  $             195.00  $                 2.95  $                 2.95  $             195.00  $               30.00 
Contact: Bill Voigtman 6 58 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
coastlinepumping@gmail.com 7 63 Meter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Hr. Min

Coast Line Concrete Pumping, LLC

Bids Opened: August 3, 2021

One Bid Received
Awarded Items in Yellow

IFB 21-017/KJS Term Contract for 
Concrete Pumping Truck Services
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