
(IFB 20-007/KJS) Term Contract for Grass Seed and Cover Seed
Final Bid Tab- July 9, 2020 ALL BIDDERS AWARDED IN ORDER OF LOWEST PRICE PER ITEM & AVAILABILITY 

If the lowest bidder can not supply the product in the necessary timeframe dictated by the project the District will proceed to the next lowest until the item is procured

Phone: 903-597-6637 Phone: 713-305-8212 Phone: 409-296-2127 Phone: 216-706-9250
Contact: Marshall Crouch Contact: Roger Castruita Contact: Toni Spencer Contact: Keith McGinty

Line Item Item Discription
Unit of 

Measure
1 Millet Seed- German Foxtail 50 lb Bag
2 Millet Seed- Pearl 50 lb Bag

3
Bermuda Seed- Texas Tough Plus (see 
specs for mix) 50 lb Bag

4 Rye Grass Seed- Gulf Annual 50 lb Bag
5 Bahia Grass Seed- TifQuick 40 lb Bag
6 Johnson Grass Seed 50 lb Bag
7 Texas Wild Flower- Mix 1 lb Bag
8 Crimson Clover Seed 50 lb Bag
9 Crabgrass 50 lb Bag

10 TeffGrass 50 lb Bag

11
Hydromulch 2000 pro plus wood fiber with 
tack 50 lb Bag

12 Cellulose Fiber 50 lb Bag
Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening. The County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any

determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements. In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.

115.00$                                        
28.00$                                          

175.00$                                         
35.00$                                           

390.00$                                          
40.00$                                            

360.00$                                          
170.00$                                          

30.00$                                            

450.00$                                         
24.00$                                           

65.00$                                          

Price Per Bag
41.46$                                            

NO BID

443.42$                                          
32.17$                                            

107.00$                                          
NO BID

18.73$                                            
107.00$                                          

Price Per Bag
45.00$                                          
76.00$                                          

460.00$                                        
29.50$                                          

290.00$                                        

East Texas Seed Company
16802 Lee Rd.

Humble, Texas 

412.50$                                         

marshallcrouch@easttexasseedcompany.com

1030D E Commerce St
Tyler, Texas 75702

55.00$                                           

Price Per Bag
25.00$                                            
25.00$                                            

130.00$                                          

Price Per Bag
37.00$                                           
68.00$                                           

275.00$                                         

185.00$                                         

NO BID
NO BID

25.00$                                            
50.00$                                            

44.00$                                            
21.00$                                            

290.00$                                        
140.00$                                        

27.50$                                          
17.00$                                          

NO BID
NO BID

18.73$                                            
10.42$                                            

mjfert@msn.com bids@siteone.comrcastruita@southernerosion.net

M&J Fertilizer Company
515 First Street

SiteOne Landscaping Supply
1385 East 36th Street

Winnie, Texas 77665 Cleveland, Ohio 44114

Southern Erosion, LLC
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