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Item Description Unit Cost Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit of Measure

1 Minimum Charge for vacuum truck  $                        320.00 each  $                        480.00 each  $                        380.00 each
1.1 Hourly rate per day  $                          80.00 hour  $                        120.00 hour  $                          95.00 hour
1.2 Vehicle rate per day  $                        225.00 day  $                        225.00 day  $                        250.00 day
1.3 Boat rate per day  $                        675.00 day  $                        950.00 day  $                        840.00 day
1.4 Absorbent boom  $                            2.40 foot  $                            2.88 foot  $                            5.00 foot
1.5 Floating boom per foot  $                            1.35 foot  $                            1.75 foot  $                            3.00 foot
1.6 Absorbent pads per bale  $                          45.00 bale  $                          70.00 bale  $                          90.00 bale
1.7 Particulate absorbent matter  $                          22.50 bag  $                            1.00 pound  $                            0.63 pound
1.8 Roll-off fees (Per Event)  $                        870.00 20 cubic yards  $                     1,225.00 20 cubic yards  $                          22.00 20 cubic yards
1.9 Roll-off fees (Per Event)  $                        970.00 40 cubic yards  $                     1,500.00 40 cubic yards  $                          25.00 40 cubic yards
1.1 Personal protection equipment, Level A  $                     2,120.00 each  $                        900.00 each  $                        950.00 each

1.11 Personal protection equipment, Level B  $                        148.00 each  $                        500.00 each  $                        275.00 each
1.12 Personal protection equipment, Level C  $                        131.00 each  $                        150.00 each  $                          95.00 each
1.13 Personal protection equipment, Level D  $                          46.00 each  $                          50.00 each  $                          15.00 each
1.14 Ropes, ½”  $                            6.10 foot  $                            0.30 foot  $                            0.17 foot
1.15 Stakes  $                            8.55 each  $                          40.00 each  $                            0.67 each
1.16 Drum with lid and closure new  $                        121.50 each  $                          90.00 each  $                          95.00 each
1.17 Drum with lid and closure reconditioned  $                        121.50 each no bid each  $                          75.00 each
1.18 Drum with lid and closure recovery  $                        121.50 each no bid each  $                          95.00 each
1.19 Drum with lid and closure salvage  $                        189.00 each no bid each  $                          95.00 each
1.2 Drum with lid and closure overpack  $                        225.00 each  $                        300.00 each  $                        275.00 each

1.21
Spill kit, (to include absorbent pads, absorbent booms (3" x 
4'), rubber gloves, and a disposal bag

 $                          59.00 each  $                        450.00 each  $                        165.00 each

1.22 Skimmer boat (if required) (indicate hour or day)  $                     4,500.00 hour or day  $                     4,500.00 hour or day  $                        295.00 hour or day

2.1 Supervisor rate per hour $58.50 to $87.75 hour  $                          85.00 hour  $                          95.00 hour
2.2 Helper rate per hour $36.00to $54.00 hour  $                          58.00 hour  $                          65.00 hour

3.1 Diesel  $                            0.28 gallon no bid gallon  $                            1.11 gallon
3.2 Gasoline  $                            0.50 gallon no bid gallon  $                            1.11 gallon
3.3 Antifreeze  $                            0.28 gallon no bid gallon  $                            2.18 gallon
3.4 Acids and bases Case by Case gallon no bid gallon  $                            5.91 gallon
3.5 Used Motor Oil  $                            0.28 gallon no bid gallon  $                            2.73 gallon
3.6 Hydraulic Fluid  $                            0.28 gallon no bid gallon  $                            2.73 gallon
3.7 Empty drum  $                          40.00 gallon no bid gallon  $                          26.00 each

4.1 Supplemental sampling fee  $                        250.00 each no bid each  $                        260.00 each
4.2 Total Petroleum Hydrocarbon (TPH)  $                          50.00 each no bid each  $                          52.00 each
4.3 Toxicity Characteristics Leachate Procedure (TCLP)  $                        150.00 each no bid each  $                        494.00 each
4.4 Benzene, Toluene, Ethyl benzene and Xylene (BTEX)  $                          75.00 each no bid each  $                          39.00 each
4.5 Reactivity, Corrosivity and Ignitability (RCI)  $                          95.00 each no bid each  $                        137.00 each 
4.6 Total Organic Halides (TOX)  $                        125.00 each no bid each  $                        208.00 each
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