AGENDA

MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
Of
JEFFERSON COUNTY DRAINAGE DISTRICT NO. 6

Will Be Held At
9:00 A.M.
August 11, 2020

at
6550 Walden Road
Beaumont, Texas 77707

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN in accordance with order of the Office of the

Governor issued March 16, 2020. Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 will
conduct a Regular Meeting, scheduled for Tuesday, August 11, 2020 at 9 a.m.,
located at Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6, 6550 Walden Road,
Beaumont, Texas 77707, by remote electronic means in order to advance the
public health goal of limiting face-to-face meetings (also called “social distancing”)
to slow the spread of the Coronavirus (COVID-19). There will be no public access to
the location above.

How TO PARTICIPATE IN THE ZOOM WEBINAR AS AN ATTENDEE

Register in advance for this Webinar at:
https://zoom.us/webinar/register/WN_iyhNM6yxR7eq81wo6K5T8A

Webinar Date: August 11, 2020 09:00 AM Central Time (US and Canada)

Webinar Topic: Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 Meeting of the Board of Directors

After registering, Attendee will receive a confirmation email containing
information about joining the webinar.

If you cannot register via a computer, please call the District at (409) 842-1818 by 4:00 P.M. on
Monday, August 10, 2020. A District employee will register you and give you a phone number
to call into the Webinar to offer public comments.

@ U 0 w »

Meeting called to order.
Call Roll.

Pledge of Allegiance.
Invocation.

Workshop Session.

1. Draft 2020-2021 Budget discussion.

2. Easements, street abandonments, and plat reviews.

3. General discussion and reports on various drainage plans and projects.

Public Comments.

Public Comments (3 minutes each) — An opportunity for the public to address the
Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 Board of Directors on agenda items or
concerns not on the agenda — those wishing to speak must register in advance for
this Webinar at: https://zoom.us/webinar/register/WN_iyhNM6yxR7eq81wo6K5T8A
and observe a three-minute time limit. Members of the public who utilize a
translator to address the Board shall be allowed six (6) minutes to address the
Board.
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Approve the minutes of July 14, 2020.

Business session:

1.

Consider a resolution authorizing the payment of routine bills received
since July 14, 2020, that were not expressly authorized or denied for
payment elsewhere on this agenda.

Consider a resolution acknowledging the receipt and filing of Jefferson
County Drainage District No. 6’s Investment Schedule for July 31,
2020, pursuant to Section 2256.023 of the Public Funds Investment
Act.

Consider a resolution authorizing the execution of a “Letter of
Engagement” with FMW, P.C., certified public accountants, for the
annual audit of the District’s financial records for the period ending
September 30, 2020.

Consider a resolution approving the District’s 2020 proposed tax
rate of $0.220587/$100 valuation as distributed below:

Proposed tax rate of $0.220587 /$100 valuation:

Maintenance and Operating: $0.220587/$100 valuation
TOTAL PROPOSED TAX RATE

FOR 2020 $0.220587/$100 valuation
TOTAL ACTUAL TAX RATE

FOR 2019 $0.220587/$100 valuation
TOTAL DECREASE /INCREASE

OVER LAST YEAR’S RATE $0.000000/$100 valuation

Consider a resolution setting a Public Hearing on Jefferson County
Drainage District No. 6’s proposed tax rate for 9:00 a.m. on
Tuesday, September 8, 2020.

In accordance with Section 415(m) of the Internal Revenue Code for
qualified governmental excess benefit programs, and as authorized
under Section 845.504 of the Government Code, consider a
resolution authorizing the adoption of a “Qualified Replacement
Benefit Arrangement” Effective January 1, 2020.

Consider a resolution approving and authorizing the execution of a
June 30, 2020 “Letter of Agreement” (on file in the District’s records)
between Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 and John and
Brenda Gilbert, wherein the District agrees to perform certain work in
exchange for a Drainage and Road Access Easement donation along
Ditch Nos. 500, 507, 507-A, 600 and 800.

Pursuant to a Letter of Agreement dated June 30, 2020, and in
connection with drainage improvements on Ditch Nos. 500, 507, 507-A,
600 and 800, consider a resolution accepting a “Drainage and Road
Access Easement” donated by John Nathan Gilbert, III and wife,
Brenda Holmes Gilbert, consisting of the actual width of the
corresponding ditches including improvements, plus 25 feet on each
side of the ditch tops that lie on their property situated in the T. & N.O.
RR. Survey, Section 61, Abstract 211, the T. & N.O. RR. Survey,
Section 63, Abstract 212, the T. & N.O. RR. Survey, Section 62,
Abstract 794, the F.M. Davis Survey, Abstract 746, and the R.P.
McAlister Survey, Abstract 688, Jefferson County, Texas.
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Consider a resolution authorizing the execution of a “Letter of
Agreement” dated June 28, 2020 (on file in the District’s records),
between Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 and Patricia Mitchell
Rayburn, wherein the District agrees to replace two 24-in downspouts
with aluminum headers on the field sides of the pipe (length of the
downspouts to be determined by the District), in exchange for the
donation of a Drainage Easement along Ditch No. 1000.

Pursuant to a Letter of Agreement dated June 28, 2020, and in
connection with drainage improvements on Ditch No. 1000, consider a
resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by Patricia
Mitchell Rayburn consisting of the actual width of Ditch No. 1000,
including improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the ditch top that
lies on her property located in the D. Easley Survey, Abstract 520,
Jefferson County, Texas.

Consider a resolution authorizing the execution of a “Letter of
Agreement” dated June 29, 2020 (on file in the District’s records),
between Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 and Reagan Tye
Carter, wherein the District agrees to replace one 24-in downspout with
an aluminum header on the field side of the pipe (length of the
downspout to be determined by the District), in exchange for the
donation of a Drainage Easement along Ditch No. 1000.

Pursuant to a Letter of Agreement dated June 29, 2020, and in
connection with drainage improvements on Ditch No. 1000, consider a
resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by Reagan Tye
Carter, consisting of the actual width of Ditch No. 1000, including
improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the ditch top that lies on his
property located in the D. Easley Survey, Abstract 520, Jefferson
County, Texas.

In connection with drainage improvements on Ditch No. 801, consider
a resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by James M.
Taylor consisting of the actual width of Ditch No. 801 plus 25 feet on
each side of the ditch top that lies on his property situated in the
T. & N.O. RR. Survey, Abstract 207, Section 53, Jefferson County,
Texas.

In connection with drainage improvements on Ditch Nos. 505 and
S505-F, consider a resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated
by Avis Marie Clubb consisting of the actual width of Ditch Nos. 505
and 505-F, including improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the
ditch tops that lie on her property located in the J.C. Lawhon Survey,
Abstract 35, Jefferson County, Texas.

In connection with drainage improvements on Ditch No. 801, consider
a resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by J.R.
Resources Concepts, LLC consisting of the actual width of Ditch
No. 801, including improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the ditch
top that lies on their property located in the T. & N.O. RR. Survey,
Abstract 207, Section 53, Jefferson County, Texas.

In connection with drainage improvements on Ditch Nos. 8102-B1 and
8102-B1A, consider a resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement”
donated by Donald Deaton consisting of the actual width of Ditch
Nos. 8012-B1 and 8102-B1A, including improvements, plus 25 feet on
each side of the ditch tops that lie on his property located in the
Stephen Easton Survey, Abstract 22, Jefferson County, Texas.
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In connection with Ditch Nos. 710, 713, and 713-A, consider a
resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by John Carl
Deaton, Jr. consisting of the actual width of Ditch Nos. 710, 713, and
713-A, including improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the ditch
tops that lie on his property located in the Stephen Easton Survey,
Abstract 22, Jefferson County, Texas.

In connection with Ditch Nos. 507, 507-A, 800, and 801, consider a
resolution accepting a “Drainage Easement” donated by Robert W.
Aldrich consisting of the actual width of Ditch Nos. 507 and 507-A,
including improvements, plus 25 feet on each side of the ditch tops
that lie on his property, and a 10.085-acre tract along Ditch Nos. 800
and 801, all situated in the T. & N.O. R.R. Survey, Section 61, Abstract 211,
the T. & N.O. R.R. Survey, Section 53, Abstract 207, and the F. M. Davis Survey,
Abstract 46, Jefferson County, Texas.

In connection with Item No. 37 on the June 9, 2020 Agenda
acknowledging the receipt proposals received for RFP 20-002/KJS-
Aerial Services for Herbicide Applications (distributed to the District’s
Evaluation Committee), consider a resolution ratifying the Evaluation
Committee’s award recommendation to Industrial Helicopters, for
10 gallons per acre at $38.00/acre and 15 gallons per acre at
$45.00/acre; and authorizing the execution of a contract for same.

Ratify the execution of a Professional Engineering Services Agreement
(PROF 20-015/KJS) with Huitt-Zollars, Inc. for a Concrete Channel
Condition Assessment, in an amount not to exceed $45,000.00.

Consider a resolution authorizing the execution of a Professional
Services Agreement (PROF 20-027/KJS) with LJA Engineering to
update the District’s Spill Prevention, Control and Countermeasure
Plan and provide inspection services, in an amount not to exceed
$7,400 for the plan development and $3,000 per year for inspection
services related to the plan.

Consider a resolution ratifying bid awards for IFB 20-017/KJS-
High-density Polyethylene Pipe and Fittings, Pre-cast Reinforced
Concrete Pipe, and Boxes for the Elinor Street Project, funded 75%
FMA Grant and 25% TWDB Grant to ACT Pipe & Supply, Coburn
Supply, and Fortiline, Inc. d/b/a Fortiline Waterworks in the amounts
shown on the attached Final Bid Tabulation (attached hereto and
incorporated herein by reference); and also ratifying Acceptance of
Offers executed by the General Manager on July 28, 2020.

Consider a resolution ratifying bid awards for IFB 20-018/KJS- HDPE
Pipe and Fittings and Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Pipe for the Byrd
Gully FEMA FMA Grant Project (Ditch No. 1205), funded 75% FMA
Grant and 25% TWDB Grant to ACT Pipe & Supply and Fortiline, Inc.
d/b/a Fortiline Waterworks in the amounts shown on the attached
Final Bid Tabulation (attached hereto and incorporated herein by
reference); and also ratifying Acceptance of Offers executed by the
General Manager on July 28, 2020.
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Consider a resolution authorizing a bid award for IFB 20-020/KJS-
Heavy Materials for: Term Contract for Jefferson County Drainage
District No. 6; Elinor Drainage Relief Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TWBD
Rainy Day Fund; Byrd Gully Ditch-1205 Project: FEMA FMA Grant,
TWBD Rainy Day Fund; and South China Relief Project: FEMA HMGP
Grant, TWDB Rainy Day Fund, opened during a public administrative
bid opening held on July 30, 2020, to Knife River Corporation, Martin
Marietta Materials, Inc., and Texas Materials Group, Inc., d/b/a Gulf
Coast a CRH Company in the amounts shown on the attached Final
Bid Tabulation (attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference);
and also authorizing the execution of Acceptance of Offers for same.

Consider a resolution acknowledging that no responsive bids were
received for IFB 20-021/KJS-Reinforcement for Concrete for: Term
Contract for Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6; Elinor Drainage
Relief Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TWDB Rainy Day Fund; Byrd Gully
Ditch- 1205 Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TWDB Rainy Day Fund; South
China Relief Project: FEMA HMGP Grant, TWDB Rainy Day Fund.

Consider a resolution ratifying bid specifications, advertising of the bid
solicitation and an administrative bid opening set for August 20, 2020
for IFB 20-027/KJS — Re-Bid Item 440-Reinforcement of Concrete for
the Elinor Drainage Relief Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TWDB Rainy Day
Fund and the Byrd Gully (Ditch-1205) Project: FEMA FMA Grant,
TWDB Rainy Day Fund.

Consider a resolution accepting the sealed bid of Coast Machinery, LLC
for IFB 20-026/KJS-Marsh Master or Equivalent, opened during a
public administrative bid opening held on July 30, 2020, in the amount
of $173,600.00. for a Marsh Master MM-2XL-KC equipped with a
cutter; a 110-gallon spray rig attachment, and trailer; and also
authorizing the execution of an Acceptance of Offer for same.

In connection with IFB 19-012/KJS - 10-Ton Class, D5K Dozer,
consider a resolution rejecting all bids received on September 26, 2019.

Consider a resolution authorizing the execution of an Application and
Agreement for Storm Drainpipe Tie-In Permit 2020-SDP-9 submitted by
Brownstone Construction, Ltd., granting them permission to tie a
24-inch CPP line into Ditch No. 123-A1A (east of Major Dr. and south
of Northwest Parkway).

Board comments, no action items.

Adjournment.

Posted: August 7, 2020

BY:  TLA 2/ 44/7 g
r/.Jgef)h G. Majdalant, P.E.

eneral Manager
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FINAL BID TABULATION (IFB 20-017/KJS) ,High-density Polyethylene Pipe and Fittings and Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Pipe
and Boxes for use on the Elinor Street Project. Funded 75% FMA Grant and 25% TWDB Grant
FINAL BID TABULATION
Fortiline, Inc. dba Fortiline
Waterworks ACT Pipe & Supply Coburn Supply Core & Main LP
7025 Northwinds Drive, NW 1405 Ashley St. 1000 Bowie St. 8010 College St.
Concord, North Carolina 28027 Beaumont, Texas 77701 Beaumont, Texas 77701 Beaumont, Texas 77707
Attn: Al Johnston Attn: Rick Rasberry Attn: Matthew Hebert Attn: Eric Ripper

alexander.johnston@fortiline.com actpi
Phone: 832-570-3191 Phone: 409-813-2796
HDPE PIPE for ELINOR STREET T =

Price Per Linear

mhebert@coburns.com er@coreandmain.com
Phone: 409-254-4578 Phone: 409-866-1899

Price Per Linear Price Per Linear Price Per Linear

Line # Description Unit | Quantity Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price
1 24" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF ] 300LF |$ 20.98 | $ 6,294.00| $ 19.99] $ 5,997.00| $ 20.32| $ 6,096.00] $ 20.33| $ 6,099.00
2 48" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF | 660LF |$ 47.891] % 31,607.40] $ 4589 % 30,287.40] $ 56.63| $ 37,375.80] $ 56.64| $ 37,382.40
3 60" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF | 680LF |$ 88.97| 3% 60,499.60| $ 8525| % 57,970.00| $ 86.22| $ 58,629.60] $ 86.22} $ 58,629.60
4 Subtotal Line 1 through 3 $ 98,401.00 $ 94,254.40 $ 102,101.40 $ 102,111.00
DPE PIP 0 OR R
Line # Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

48" HP Storm Dual Wall Dissimilar

5 |Material Adaptor Fitting HDPE to RCP| EA 1 $ 1,24065]1 $ 1,24065| $ 1,113.55| $ 1,113.55] $ 1,125.53| $ 1,125.53| $ 1,12554 | $ 1,125.54
(ADS Part No. 4821ANP)

48" HP Storm Dual Wall 22.5° Bend
6 (ADS Part No. 4892ANG5BP) EA 2 $ 995.13| $ 1,990.26( $ 893.15| $ 1,786.30] $ 849431 % 1,698.86) $ 90280 $ 1,805.60

48" x 24" HP Storm

7 Dual Wall Reducing Tee EA 13 $ 1,518.701 $ 19,743.10| $ 1,363.15| $ 17,72095( $ 137779 $ 17,911.27| $ 1,377.80| $ 17,911.40
(ADS Part No. 4867AN65BP)

60" HP Storm
Dual Wall Dissimilar Material
8 Adaptor Fitting HDPE to RCP EA 1 $ 1,64280] $ 1,642.80] $ 1474551 $ 1,474.55| $ 1,490.37| $ 1,490.37] $ 1,490.38| $ 1,490.38

(ADS Part No. 6021ANP)
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60" HP Storm
9 Dual Wall 22.5° Bend EA 3 3 1,684.82] $ 5,054.46) $ 1,51225] $ 4,536.75| $ 1,438.16 | $ 4,314.48] % 1,528.50 $ 4,585.50
(ADS Part No. 6092AN65BP)
60" x 24" HP Storm
10 Dual Wall Reducing Tee EA 5 $ 2,16461| $ 10,823.05| $ 1,94295( $ 9,714.75| $ 1,963.77| $ 9,818.85]| % 1,963.78 | $ 9,818.90
(ADS Part No. 6067AN65BP)
60" x 18" HP Storm
11 Dual Wall Reducing 45° Wye EA 1 $ 137256 $ 1,372.56| $ 1,232.001 $ 1,232.00| $ 1,24520| $ 1,245.201 $ 1,245.21] % 1,245.21
(ADS Part No. 6086AN65BP)
12 Subtotal Line 5 through 11 $ 41,866.88 $ 37,578.85 $ 37,604.56 $ 37,982.53
R DR D CO R PIP
: - . .. | Price Per Linear . Price Per Linear : Price Per Linear . Price Per Linear :
Line # Description Unit | Quantity Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price
13 | 48” RCP Class Ill Tongue and Grove| LF 30LF |$ 108.721 $ 3,261.60| $ 96.40| $ 2,892.00] % 108.15| $ 324450 % 111.58] % 3,347.40
14 Subtotal Line Item 13 $ 3,261.60 $ 2,892.00 $ 3,244.50 $ 3,347.40
R OR D CO R ={o
Line # Description Unit | Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
30” x 30” x 36” Catch Basin complete
15 with 34” x 34 Grate EA 14 $ 72581 % 10,161.34 | $ 588.00] $ 8,232.00| % 576.801 % 8,075.20| $ 1,076.85]| $ 15,075.90
727 x 72” x 94” Type ‘C’ Curb Inlet
16 | complete with Slab Top. Risers, curb| EA 1 $ 2,419.35|% 2,41935] % 3,144.75] $ 3,144.75| $ 3,370.68) $ 3,37068 | $ 3,656.85] % 3,656.85
top ring and cover cast-in
36” x 36” x 64” Type ‘C-1’ Curb Inlet
17 complete with mid-section, top EA 4 $ 2,795.70 | $ 11,182.80| $ 1,238.48| $ 4,953.92 1% 1,654.70| $ 6,618.80] % 1,451.58 | % 5,806.32
section, ring and cover cast-in
60” x 60” x 78” Type ‘A’ Inlet
18 | Complete with slab top and 30” x 30| EA 1 $ 1,989.25| $ 1,989.25( % 1,617.00| $ 1,617.00) $ 1,802.50| $ 1,802.50 | $ 2642111 % 2,642.11
Type ‘A’ frame and grate
19 Subtotal Line Items 15 through 18 $ 25,752.74 $ 17,947.67 $ 19,867.18 3 27,181.18
OTAL BID
D 69 .28 > 0 9 52,8 04 d U.6
= - 4 2 °
Multiple Vendor
Award Total S 151,481.01 2% Option S 3,256.35
> One Bidder S 1,191.91 Option total S 159,561.29
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FINAL BID TABULATION

(IFB 20-018/KJS) ,High-density Polyethylene Pipe and Fittings and Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Pipe

for use on the Byrd Gully Project. Funded 75% FMA Grant and 25% TWDB Grant
FINAL BID TABULATION

Waterworks ACT Pipe & Supply Coburn Supply Core & Main LP
7025 Northwinds Drive, NW 1405 Ashley St. 1000 Bowie St. 8010 College St.
Concord, North Carolina 28027 Beaumont, Texas 77701 Beaumont, Texas 77701 Beaumont, Texas 77707
Attn: AJ Johnston Attn: Rick Rasberry Attm: Matthew Hebert Attn: Eric Ripper
alexander.johnston@fortiline.com rrasberry@actpipe.com mhebert@coburns.com ic.ri
Phone: 832-570-3191 Phone: 409-813-2796 Phone: 409-254-4578
HDPE PIPE for BYRD GULLY DITCH 1205 , :
. e g . Price Per Linear . Price Per Linear . Price Per Linear . Price Per Linear .
Line # Description Unit Quantity Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price Foot Total Price
1 24" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF 1600 | $ 2054 | $ 32,864.00] $ 1999 | $ 31,984.00| $ 2032 | $ 32,512.00| $ 2055 | $ 32,880.00
2 42" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF 120 $ 4690 | $ 5,628.00) $ 4590 | $ 5,508.00 | $ 4640 | $ 5,568.00| $ 46.90 | $ 5,628.00
3 60" HP Storm Dual Wall Pipe LF 80 $ 87111 % 6,968.80] $ 8525 | $ 6,820.00| $ 86.22 | $ 6,897.60| $ 8712 | $ 6,969.60
4 Subtotal Line 1 through 3 $ 45,460.80 $ 44,312.00 $ 44,977.60 $ 45,477.60
R OR D CO R PIP
Line # Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
5 72" RCP Class lll Tongue and Grove LF 120 $ 24211 | $ 29,053.20 | $ 246.35 | $ 29,562.00 | $ 246.37 | $ 29,564.40 | $ 261.90 | $ 31,428.00
6 84" RCP Class Ill Tongue and Grove LF 120 $ 326.32 | $ 39,158.40 | $ 33475 | § 40,170.00 | $ 33475 | $ 40,170.00 | $ 34737 | $ 41,684.40
7 Subtotal Line Items 5 through 6 68,211.60 69,732.00 69,734.40 73,112.40

ROIALEID ._‘_m.mvm.ao,_ 114,044.00 ST 114,712,00 . > $  118,590.00

SUM Line ltems 4, and 7

Multiple Vendor
Award Total 5 112,523.60 2% Option S 2,294.24
> One Bidder S 1,148.80 Option Total S 112,417.76
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Final Tab IFB 20-020/KIS

Item Heavy Materials for: Term Contract for
Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 &Elinor
Drainage Relief Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TCEQ
Rainy Day Fund & Byrd Gully Ditch- 1205 Project:

FEMA FMA Grant, TCEQ Rainy Day Fund

Byrd Gully Hydraulic Caoncrete

Item No.

Item Descr. Cl

421

6201 360 C.Y.

Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba
Gulf Coast a CRH Company

12907 US Highway 90

Beaumont, Texas 77713

Attn: Arthur Tucker

No Bid No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials

5675 Fannett Road

Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Bill Kelley

Modern Concrete &
Materials, LLC

2090 W. Cardinal Dr.

Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Trent Almond

talmond@modernconcretet

$ 105.00 | $ 37,800.00 | $

xX.com

115.00 | $ 41,400.00 | $

Knife River Corpaoration-
South

P.O. Box 20257

Beaumont, Texas 77720

Attn: Toby Burns

122.00 | $ 43,920.00

SCM = Supplementary Cementing Materials
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Final Tab IFB 20-020/KJS

Item Heavy Materials for: Term Contract for lefferson County
Drainage District No. 6 &Elinor Drainage Relief Project: FEMA FMA
Grant, TCEQ Rainy Day Fund & Byrd Gully Ditch- 1205 Project: FEMA
FMA Grant, TCEQ Rainy Day Fund

Table-03 Cement-Stabilized Sand - Addendum No. 01

Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba

Martin Marietta Materials
Gulf Coast a CRH Company i rea e

12907 US Highway 90 5675 Fannett Road
Beaumont, Texas 77713 Beaumont, Texas 77705
Attn: Arthur Tucker Attn: Bill Kelley

Moadern Concrete &
Materials, LLC

2090 W. Cardinal Dr.
Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Trent Almond

etetx.com

Knife River Corporation- South

P.O. Box 20257
Beaumont, Texas 77720

Attn: Toby Burns

toby.burns@kniferiver.com

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
item No. Item Descr. Description Delivered Picked-Up  Delivered Picked-Up Delivered Picked-Up Delivered Picked-Up
(Per TON) (PerTON) (PerTON)4  (PerTON)S (PerTON)5 (PerTON)6 (PerTON)6 (Per TON)7
400 6001 Cement-Stabilized Sand (1.5-Sack/Ton) Plant Mixed S 24.00
400 6002 Cement-Stabilized Sand (3-Sack/Ton) Plant Mixed 1 TON | S 42.00 | $ 35.00) $ 37.00|S$ 32.00 S 51.00 | $ 35.00
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Final Tab IFB 20-020/KJS

Item Heavy Materials for: Term Contract for Jefferson County
Drainage District No. 6 &Elinor Drainage Relief Project: FEMA FMA
Grant, TCEQ Rainy Day Fund & Byrd Gully Ditch- 1205 Project:
FEMA FMA Grant, TCEQ Rainy Day Fund

Elinor Street Project Hydraulic Concrete

Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6

Item | Item
No. | Descr.
421 | 6201

Table-02 Concrete Classes DDE6 - Concrete Classes w/100% Cement

A 3,000 0.60

LILI/ILILIP,IS,IT, V)] 1,2,4,&7

40

C.Y.

Texas Materials Group, Inc.,
dba Gulf Coast a CRH
Company
12907 US Highway 90

Beaumont, Texas 77713

Attn: Arthur Tucker

No Bid No Bid

Martin Marietta Materials

5675 Fannett Road

Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Bill Kelley

$  105.00 | $ 44,200.00

Modern Concrete & Materials,
LLC

2090 W. Cardinal Dr.

Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Trent Almond

talmond@modernconcretetx.c
om

$ 11500 $  4,600.00

Knife River Corporation-
South

P.0O. Box 20257

Beaumont, Texas 77720

Attn: Toby Burns

toby.burns@kniferiver.co

$ 122.00 | $ 4,880.00

Agenda for August 11, 2020 - Board of Directors Meeting
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Vendor shall use TxDOT Specification(2014) Item 421 -
Hydraullc Cement Concrete

FINAL BID TABULATION IFB 20/020/ KIS Item Heavy Materlals for: Term Contract for Jeff

County Dralnage District No. 6 &Elinar Dralnage Relief Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TCEQ Ralny Uu<§- Supg y

Fund & Byrd Gully Ditch- 1205 Project: FEMA FMA Grant, TCEQ Ralny Day Fund

7

Texas Materials Group, Inc., dba Gulf|
Coast a CRH Company

12907 US Highway 90
Texas 77713

Attn: Arthur Tucker

Martin Marietta Materials

5675 Fannett Road
Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Bill Kelley

Modern Concrete & Materials,
e

2050 W. Cardinal Dr,
Beaumont, Texas 77705

Attn: Trent Almand

nd@®modemconcretetx.co

Knife River Corporation- South

P.O. Box 20257
Beaumont, Texas 77720

Attn: Toby Burns

hur.tucker®ge- i toby.burns@kniferiver.com
The supplier should provide a unit price for 100% cement. If the supplier chooses to :“-ﬂ.-ﬂ_o.u.z_n mix design options for bidding their will be no change In unit price if SCM are not| Addendum No. 01 Addendum No. 01 Addendum No. 01 Addendum No. 01
Item No. 421 Only item No. 421 Qaly Item No. 421 Only| tem No. 421 Only
Hn_ouwwm””qn.u = See Notes (Lessthan 9 C..) {Lessthan 9 C.Y,) {Less than 9 C.Y.} (Less than 3 C.Y.)
Short Load Shart Load Short Load Short Load
oy 1 Design “Coarse E < $ . | Unit Price _Unit Price k Unit Price Unit Price
It I Class of | Strength| 1o Aggregate| | Cement X LR |\ Delivered Shli il + Delivered Unltbrlce ) pervered LRhEC ~ Delivered
em No. S0y w/cm > : 1 Design - | Delivered | Dellvered  Dellvéred { Delivered : p
Descr. Wl CITHRRS B Ratio Grades Types 7 Ouzaam Sttt | “tpercy) | (PerC.Y.) {PerCY:) (Per.C.Y.) (PerCY,) (Pec C.Y.) {Per C.) | (PerC.Y.}
2 Min fc 19234 = BN R PR ¢ 01 (Short Load) {5 1 (Short Load) 01 Short Load) - SR (Short Load)
401 6001 m”e”—w_._n Per Spec | PerSpec| PerSpec | PerSpec Per Spec Per Spec
1L 11, 1L When the cementitious material content |Curb, gutter, curb & gutter, conc. retards, sidewalks,
421 6001 A2 3,000 0.60 2 _.v s, :.‘. v 1,2,4,8&7 |does not exceed 520 Ib./cu. yd., Class C fly | driveways, back-up walls, anchors, non-reinforced drilled $ $ $ 105.00 | $ - $ 11500($ - $ 12700 S 143.00
s ash may be used instead of Class F fly ash. |shafts.
L, /L When the cementitious material content |Curb, gutter, curb & gutter, conc. retards, sidewalks,
421 6002 A4 3,000 0.60 4 iudifiel 1,2,4, &7 |does not exceed 520 Ib./cu. yd., Class C fly back-up walls, anchors, non-reinforced drilled | $ - $ - $ 105.00]$ - $ 11500 % $ 12200( 5 144.00
AL ash may be used Instead of Class F fly ash. [shafts.
L, When the cementitious material content |Curb, gutter, curb & gutter, conc. retards, sidewalks, $ - $ $ $ 152.00
421 6003 A-8 3,000 0.60 8 _.v 1s _.h‘ v 1,2,4,8&7 |doesnot exceed 520 Ib./cu. yd., Class C fly back-up walls, anchors, non-reinforced drilled $ $ 105.00 $  115.00 $ 13000
wdr] ash may be used Instead of Class F fly ash. |shafts.
110, 41, P, Drilled shafts, bridge substructure, bridge railing, culverts $ - $ z $ & $ 156.00
421 6004 C2,6 3,600 0.45 2 n ST ...\ <. 1-8 except top slab of direct traffic culverts, headwalls, wing $ = $ 108.00 $ - $ 13400
et walls, inlets, manholes, concrete traffic barrier (cast-in-
1L LI P Drilled shafts, bridge substructure, bridge railing, culverts $ & $ - $ - $ 151.00
421 6005 C4,% 3,600 0.45 4 n s .:‘ ...~ <. 1-8 except top slab of direct traffic culverts, headwalls, wing $ $  108.00 $ - $ 129.00
i walls, inlets, concrete traffic barrier (cast-in-
1L, 1/, P, Bridge slabs, top slabs of direct traffic culverts, approach $ - $ - $ - $ 156.00
421 6006 52,%6 4,000 045 2 14 ool 1-8 slabs. $ - $ 11100 $ 12500 $ 13400
IS, IT,*7V
Bridge slabs, top slabs of direct traffic culverts, approach $ = $ - $ $ 151.00
421 6007 54,6 4,000 0.45 4 1-8 slabs $ - $ 11100 $ 12500 $ 12900
When the cementitious material content [Concrete pavement $ - $ = $ = $ 152.00
421 6008 P 4,000 0.50 23 18 does not exceed 520 Ib./cu. yd., Class C fly $ $ 11100 $ 12500 $ 13000
ash may be used instead of Class F fly ash.
11, 11, 1P, Use a minimum cementitious material Slurry displacement shafts, underwater drilled shafts
a21 6009 ss*6 | 3,600 0.45 46 W..:. v content of 658 Ib./cu. yd. of concrete. $ L - |$ 1200 -] $ $ 12900 $ 151.00
B
LIL U, /1 Mix design options do not apply. 700 Ib.  [Concrete pavement, concrete pavement repair
421 | 6010 | HES2 8 (T |SXCom] Rl of cementitious matertal per cublc yard $ - s - |s 14s00fs - | 30000(s - |$ 1a300)s 165.00
L limit does not apply.
LI, Mix design options do not apply. 700 Ib. | Concrete pavement, concrete pavement repair
421 6011 HES-4 °8 045 4,°8 |” ___. 4 of cementitious material per cubic yard $ - s - |$ 14s00f$ - |$ 300008 - |$ 13800(5 160.00
limit does nat apply.
WL I, I, Mix design options do not apply. 700 1b. | Ce te te repair
421 6012 HES-8 *8 045 8,8 s St of cementitious material per cubic yard $ - $ - $ 14500 | $ $ 30000($ < $ 14500/ $ 167.00
&/ limit does not apply.
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